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Warning: Rough Seas AheadWarning: Rough Seas AheadWarning: Rough Seas AheadWarning: Rough Seas Ahead    

This little zine collects comix I've made sporadically since 
2005 about my struggles with depression, PTSD, marriage 
and fatherhood. It's not fun stuff. If you want light-hearted 
fare, look elsewhere. Triggers abound. Abandon hope all ye 
who enter here. Etc., etc. 
 
When I started these toons, I was at rock bottom. I'd suffered 
a crash at the end of 2002 as all the symptoms of post-
traumatic stress bubbled to the surface. I was virtually unable 
to leave my apartment for months. Therapy and medication 
had failed miserably, even when I could afford them. My 
new partner Michelle, whom I'd married in 2001, had to carry 
this burden. In 2004 she lost her sister to cancer, and our 
daughter was born two months later. I wanted nothing more 
than to die, but I was resigned to keep plodding through to 
care for my child. 
 
Things are getting better now. I have been back in therapy 
and on meds for over a year, and this time it's actually 
helped. For the first time in my life I have been able to open 
up and seek out friends and confidants. I'm making zines and 
speaking fearlessly about the personal as well as the political. 
 
But recovery has brought new crises as well.  I am especially 
vexed by the boundaries of friendship, empathy and erotic/
sexual contact, both as someone who has always questioned 
society's hypocritical status quo, and as someone who has 
never learned to create and defend safe boundaries for him-
self. This has seriously jeopardized my relationship with my 
wife and caused heartache for me and other people I love. 
 
I want to hear what you think, especially if you have been or 
are going through similar experiences. 
 
—redguard, 9/08 
 
Contact: redguard@gmail.com 
Order from: www.absent-cause.org or redguard.etsy.com  
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